Department / Requisition: Athletics / 175138475

Description of Bid: Baseball Charter Service

Opening Date: 9/26/2023

RFQ Coordinator: Tina Girdley / tgirdley@tntech.edu

First Class Metro Livery Anchor Tours Gray Line Olympus Car & Coach
Qy | unit tem Description Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes
1 EA |Trip1: ALABAMA AGM UNIVERSITY — ‘ $ 3,200.00 | 3,200.00 2,200.00 | $ 2,200.00 1,901.04 | $ 1,991.04 229378 | $ 2,203.78 2,300.00 | $ 2,300.00
Huntsvile. AL
Trip 2: UNIVERSITY OF SC UPSTATE —
1 EA | g, S ‘ NO BID B - No Bid 5,800.00| 5,800.00 6,193.20 | $ 6,193.20 812150 | $ 8,121.50 6.400.00 | $ 6.400.00
Trip3: UNIVERSITY OF SOUTHERN )
1 EN S Wit ‘ NO BID s - No Bid 5,800.00 | $ 5,800.00 619320 | $ 6,193.20 8,560.50 | $ 8,560.50 8,100.00 | $ 8,100.00
1 EA  |Trip4: UT KNOXVILLE - Knoille, TN ‘ $ 2,600.00 | 2,600.00 1,700.00 | $ 1,700.00 199104 | $ 1,991.04 177795 | $ 177795 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00
1 EA |5 LIPSCOMB UNIVERSITY - ‘ s 2,400.00 | $ 2,400.00 1,700.00 | $ 1,700.00 1,991.40 | $ 1,991.40 1,777.95 | s 1,777.95 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00
Trip 6: LINDENWOOD UNIVERSITY —
1 S A v s 6,800.00 | 6,800.00 5,800.00 | $ 5,800.00 619320 | $ 6,193.20 801175 | $ 8,01L.75 8,400.00 | 8,400.00
1 EA  |Trip7: UT MARTIN - Martin, TN ‘ s 6,500.00| 6,500.00 4,900.00( $ 4,900.00 619320 | $ 6,193.20 812150 | $ 8,121.50 8,400.00 | 8,400.00
1 EA |Trip8: VANDERBILT UNIVERSITY — ‘ NO BID s - No Bid 170000 | $ 1,700.00 1,991.40 | $ 1,991.40 1,683.84 | S 1,683.84 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00
Nashville. TN
Trip 9: SOUTHERN ILLINOIS UNIVERSITY
1 A e AROVILLE - Eomdonioe s 6,000.00 | 6,000.00 5,800.00 | $ 5,800.00 619320 | $ 6,193.20 8,560.50 | 8,560.50 8,400.00 | 8,400.00
Sub-Total $ 27,500.00 $  35400.00 $ 3893088 H $ 4890927 $  47,700.00
Posasible OVC Tournament (possible 5 day) ‘
5 EA Marion, llinois (Venue: Rent One Park) | $ 1,800.00 | 9,000.00 2,200.00 | $ 11,000.00 154830 | $ 7,741.50 205781 |$  10289.05 210000 [$  10,500.00
ove Trip Tota| s 9,000.00 s 11,000.00 s 774150 s 1028005 $  10,500.00
Avgerage Cost Per Day| s 1,800.00 s 2,200.00 s 150830 s 205781 s 2100.00
TOTAL $ 29,300.00 $  37,600.00 $ 4047918 $  50,967.08 $  49,800.00
Intent to Award Dat /2712023
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