
Department / Requisition:  Athletics / 175136662

Description of Bid: Softball Charter Service

Opening Date: 10/3/2023

RFQ Coordinator:  Tina Girdley / tgirdley@tntech.edu

   

Qty Unit Item Description Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 EA Trip 1:  Presbyterian College – Clinton, 

SC

 $                     6,193.20  $                     6,193.20  $                     5,800.00  $                     5,800.00  $                     6,800.00  $                     6,800.00  $                     8,300.00  $                     8,300.00  $                     7,682.50  $                     7,682.50 

1 EA
Trip 2:  University of South Carolina 

Upstate – Spartanburg, SC
 $                     6,193.20  $                     6,193.20  $                     5,800.00  $                     5,800.00  $                     6,800.00  $                     6,800.00  $                     8,300.00  $                     8,300.00  $                     7,682.50  $                     7,682.50 

1 EA Trip 3:  University of Memphis – 

Memphis, TN

 $                     6,193.20  $                     6,193.20  $                     5,800.00  $                     5,800.00  $                     6,800.00  $                     6,800.00  $                     8,100.00  $                     8,100.00  $                     7,792.25  $                     7,792.25 

1 EA
Trip 4:  Georgia State University – 

Atlanta, GA 
 $                     4,644.90  $                     4,644.90  $                     4,800.00  $                     4,800.00  $                     5,000.00  $                     5,000.00  $                     6,500.00  $                     6,500.00  $                     6,008.81  $                     6,008.81 

1 EA
Trip 5:  Western Illinois University – 

Macomb, IL
 $                     7,767.10  $                     7,767.10  $                     4,800.00  $                     4,800.00 NO BID  $                                -    $                     6,800.00  $                     6,800.00  $                     7,185.35  $                     7,185.35 

1 EA
Trip 6:  Morehead State University – 

Morehead, KY
 $                     4,644.90  $                     4,644.90  $                     4,800.00  $                     4,800.00 NO BID  $                                -    $                     7,200.00  $                     7,200.00  $                     6,914.25  $                     6,914.25 

1 EA
Trip 7:  Southeast Missouri State 

University – Cape Girardeau, MO
 $                     4,644.90  $                     4,644.90  $                     4,800.00  $                     4,800.00 NO BID  $                                -    $                     7,200.00  $                     7,200.00  $                     6,420.38  $                     6,420.38 

1 EA
Trip 8:  Eastern Illinois University - 

Charleston, IL 
 $                     4,644.90  $                     4,644.90  $                     4,800.00  $                     4,800.00  NO BID  $                                -    $                     7,200.00  $                     7,200.00  $                     6,914.25  $                     6,914.25 

1 EA
TRIP 9 – OVC TOURNAMENT – HOST 

CITY: Peoria, Ill
 $                     1,548.30  $                     1,548.30  $                     2,200.00  $                     2,200.00  $                     1,800.00  $                     1,800.00  $                     2,100.00  $                     2,100.00  $                     1,970.01  $                     1,970.01 

TOTAL  $                46,474.60  $            43,600.00  $                27,200.00  $                61,700.00  $                58,570.30 

Olympus Car & Coach Gray Line of TennesseeFirst Class

Intent to Award Date:  10/4/2023

by contacting the TTU Associate VP of Communications at www.tntech.edu/univadv/ocm/contact-us

Note to Bidders:  If you require any additional information, please contact the Buyer listed above 

within seven (7) calendar days of the Intent to Award Date.  After that time, additional information may be requested

Anchor Tours Metro Livery


