
Department:  Athletics Highlighted cells below indicate which item is being awarded and to whom.

Description of Bid: Soccer Bus Charter

Opening Date: 6/23/2026

RFQ Coordinator:  Tina Girdley / tgirdley@tntech.edu

   

Qty Unit Item Description Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 EA Trip 1:  COASTAL CAROLINA UNIVERSITY  $                        12,243.00  $                        12,243.00  $                          7,994.25  $                          7,994.25  $                          7,500.00  $                          7,500.00  $                          6,900.00  $                          6,900.00  $                          7,500.00  $                          7,500.00 

1 EA Trip 2:  AUSTIN PEAY STATE UNIVERSITY  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          3,070.06  $                          3,070.06  $                          1,695.00  $                          1,695.00  $                          1,675.00  $                          1,675.00  $                          1,800.00  $                          1,800.00 

1 EA Trip 3:  UNIVERSITY OF NORTH ALABAMA  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          4,464.46  $                          4,464.46  $                          1,805.00  $                          1,805.00  $                          1,675.00  $                          1,675.00  $                          2,564.00  $                          2,564.00 

1 EA Trip 4:  VANDERBILT UNIVERSITY  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          2,792.79  $                          2,792.79  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,920.00  $                          1,920.00 

1 EA Trip 5:  LIPSCOMB UNIVERSITY  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          2,793.77  $                          2,793.77  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,920.00  $                          1,920.00 

1 EA Trip 6:  EAST TENNESSEE STATE UNIVERSITY  $                          3,500.00  $                          3,500.00  $                          5,630.56  $                          5,630.56  No Bid  $                                     -    $                          1,725.00  $                          1,725.00  $                          2,787.00  $                          2,787.00 

1 EA Trip 7:  UNIVERSITY OF NORTH CAROLINA AT GREENSBORO  $                          3,500.00  $                          3,500.00  $                          6,427.39  $                          6,427.39  $                          3,420.00  $                          3,420.00  $                          3,300.00  $                          3,300.00  $                          3,817.00  $                          3,817.00 

1 EA Trip 8:  MERCER UNIVERSITY  $                          3,500.00  $                          3,500.00  No Bid  $                                     -    $                          3,600.00  $                          3,600.00  $                          3,200.00  $                          3,200.00  $                          3,750.00  $                          3,750.00 

1 EA Trip 9:  SAMFORD UNIVERSITY  $                          3,500.00  $                          3,500.00  $                          4,983.35  $                          4,983.35  $                          3,400.00  $                          3,400.00  $                          3,200.00  $                          3,200.00  $                          3,188.00  $                          3,188.00 

1 EA Trip 10:  WESTERN CAROLINA UNIVERSITY  $                          3,500.00  $                          3,500.00  $                          5,138.01  $                          5,138.01  $                          2,100.00  $                          2,100.00  $                          3,100.00  $                          3,100.00  $                          3,224.00  $                          3,224.00 

TOTAL  $                        36,743.00  $                        43,294.64  $                        26,520.00  $                        27,775.00  $                        32,470.00 

1 EA Homewood, AL  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,850.00  $                          1,850.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Cullowhee, NC  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,850.00  $                          1,850.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Macon, GA  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,850.00  $                          1,850.00  $                          1,600.00  $                          1,600.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Spartanburg, SC  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,850.00  $                          1,850.00  $                          1,600.00  $                          1,600.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Greenville, SC  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,850.00  $                          1,850.00 1,600.00$                            $                          1,600.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Greensboro, NC  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,950.00  $                          1,950.00 1,700.00$                            $                          1,700.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Lexington City, VA  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,950.00  $                          1,950.00 1,750.00$                            $                          1,750.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Charleston, SC  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,950.00  $                          1,950.00 1,800.00$                            $                          1,800.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,781.00  $                          1,781.00 

1 EA Chattanooga, TN  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00 1,400.00$                            $                          1,400.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Johnson City, TN  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,850.00  $                          1,850.00 1,400.00$                            $                          1,400.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

Total  $                        17,500.00  $                        18,700.00  $                        15,850.00  $                        15,000.00  $                        16,964.00 

Average Cost Per Day  $                          5,833.33  $                          6,233.33  $                          5,283.33  $                          5,000.00  $                          5,654.67 

1 EA Homewood, AL  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00 1,850.00$                            $                          1,850.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Cullowhee, NC  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00 1,850.00$                            $                          1,850.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Macon, GA  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00 1,850.00$                            $                          1,850.00  $                          1,600.00  $                          1,600.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Spartanburg, SC  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00 1,850.00$                            $                          1,850.00  $                          1,600.00  $                          1,600.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Greenville, SC  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00 1,850.00$                            $                          1,850.00 1,600.00$                            $                          1,600.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Greensboro, NC  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00 1,950.00$                            $                          1,950.00 1,700.00$                            $                          1,700.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Lexington City, VA  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00 1,950.00$                            $                          1,950.00 1,750.00$                            $                          1,750.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Charleston, SC  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00 1,950.00$                            $                          1,950.00 1,800.00$                            $                          1,800.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,781.00  $                          1,781.00 

1 EA Chattanooga, TN  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00 1,750.00$                            $                          1,750.00 1,400.00$                            $                          1,400.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

1 EA Johnson City, TN  $                          1,750.00  $                          1,750.00 1,850.00$                            $                          1,850.00 1,400.00$                            $                          1,400.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,500.00  $                          1,687.00  $                          1,687.00 

Total 17,500.00$                         18,700.00$                         15,850.00$                         15,000.00$                         16,964.00$                         

Average Cost Per Day 5,833.33$                           6,233.33$                           5,283.33$                           5,000.00$                           5,654.67$                           

1 EA Homewood, AL  $                          1,750.00 1,750.00$                           NO BID -$                                    1,500.00$                           1,500.00$                            $                          1,500.00 1,500.00$                            $                          1,687.00 1,687.00$                           

1 EA Cullowhee, NC  $                          1,750.00 1,750.00$                           NO BID -$                                    1,500.00$                           1,500.00$                            $                          1,500.00 1,500.00$                            $                          1,687.00 1,687.00$                           

1 EA Macon, GA  $                          1,750.00 1,750.00$                           NO BID -$                                    1,600.00$                           1,600.00$                            $                          1,500.00 1,500.00$                            $                          1,687.00 1,687.00$                           

1 EA Spartanburg, SC  $                          1,750.00 1,750.00$                           NO BID -$                                    1,600.00$                           1,600.00$                            $                          1,500.00 1,500.00$                            $                          1,687.00 1,687.00$                           

1 EA Greenville, SC  $                          1,750.00 1,750.00$                           NO BID -$                                    1,600.00$                           1,600.00$                            $                          1,500.00 1,500.00$                            $                          1,687.00 1,687.00$                           

1 EA Greensboro, NC  $                          1,750.00 1,750.00$                           NO BID -$                                    1,700.00$                           1,700.00$                            $                          1,500.00 1,500.00$                            $                          1,687.00 1,687.00$                           

1 EA Lexington City, VA  $                          1,750.00 1,750.00$                           NO BID -$                                    1,750.00$                           1,750.00$                            $                          1,500.00 1,500.00$                            $                          1,687.00 1,687.00$                           

1 EA Charleston, SC  $                          1,750.00 1,750.00$                           NO BID -$                                    1,800.00$                           1,800.00$                            $                          1,500.00 1,500.00$                            $                          1,781.00 1,781.00$                           

1 EA Chattanooga, TN  $                          1,750.00 1,750.00$                           NO BID -$                                    1,400.00$                           1,400.00$                            $                          1,500.00 1,500.00$                            $                          1,687.00 1,687.00$                           

1 EA Johnson City, TN  $                          1,750.00 1,750.00$                           NO BID -$                                    1,400.00$                           1,400.00$                            $                          1,500.00 1,500.00$                            $                          1,687.00 1,687.00$                           

Total 17,500.00$                         -$                                    15,850.00$                         15,000.00$                         16,964.00$                         

Average Cost Per Day 5,833.33$                           -$                                    5,283.33$                           5,000.00$                           5,654.67$                           

TOTAL 54,243.00$                         55,761.31$                         42,370.00$                         42,775.00$                         49,434.00$                         

NOTES:

Note to Bidders: If you require any additional information, please contact the Buyer listed above within seven (7) calendar days of the Intent to Award Date.  After that time, additional information may be requested by contacting the TTU Associate VP of 

Communications at www.tntech.edu/univadv/ocm/contact-us

TRIP 11 - Rounds 1 

TRIP 12 - Quarter Final

Intent to Award Date*:  6/25/2026

TRIP 13 - Semifinal

 3 Day Minimum Required 

Metro Livery First Class Charter Priority Coach Signature TransportationMartin Motor Coach

 3 Day Minimum Required 

 3 Day Minimum Required 


