
Department / Requisition:  Athletics / 208000952 Highlighted cells below  indicate w hich item is being aw arded and to w hom.

Description of Bid: Track & Field Charter Service

Opening Date: 11/19/2025

RFQ Coordinator:  Tina Girdley / tgirdley@tntech.edu

   

Qty Unit Item Description Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes

1 EA Trip 1:   University of Alabama-Birmingham – Birmingham, AL  $                                 3,300.00  $                                 3,300.00  $                                 3,498.00  $                                 3,498.00  $                                 3,600.00  $                                 3,600.00  $                                 3,849.00  $                                 3,849.00  $                                 2,812.00  $                                 2,812.00  $                                 6,500.00  $                                 6,500.00  $                                 6,600.00  $                                 6,600.00 

1 EA Trip 2:   OVC Indoor Championship – Louisville, KY  $                                 4,900.00  $                                 4,900.00  $                                 5,247.00  $                                 5,247.00  $                                 4,950.00  $                                 4,950.00  $                                 5,676.00  $                                 5,676.00  $                                 4,218.00  $                                 4,218.00  $                                 9,750.00  $                                 9,750.00  $                                 9,900.00  $                                 9,900.00 

1 EA Trip 3:   University of Alabama-Birmingham – Birmingham, AL  NO BID  $                                              -    $                                 3,498.00  $                                 3,498.00  No Bid  $                                              -    $                                 3,849.00  $                                 3,849.00  $                                 3,600.00  $                                 3,600.00  $                                 6,500.00  $                                 6,500.00  $                                 6,600.00  $                                 6,600.00 

1 EA Trip 4:   Western Carolina University – Cullowhee, NC  $                                 3,500.00  $                                 3,500.00  $                                 3,498.00  $                                 3,498.00  No Bid  $                                              -    $                                 3,684.00  $                                 3,684.00  $                                 3,490.00  $                                 3,490.00  $                                 6,500.00  $                                 6,500.00  $                                 6,600.00  $                                 6,600.00 

TOTAL  $                      11,700.00  $                                   -    $                      15,741.00  $                        8,550.00  $                      17,058.00  $                      14,120.00  $                      29,250.00  $                      29,700.00 

1 EA Little Rock, AR / Coleman Sports Complex  NO BID  $                                              -    $                                 1,749.00  $                                 1,749.00  No Bid  $                                              -    $                                 1,892.00  $                                 1,892.00  $                                 1,695.00  $                                 1,695.00  $                                 3,250.00  $                                 3,250.00  $                                 3,300.00  $                                 3,300.00 

OVC Trip Total -$                                            1,749.00$                                  -$                                            1,892.00$                                  1,695.00$                                  3,250.00$                                  3,300.00$                                  

Avgerage Cost Per Day -$                                            437.25$                                     -$                                            473.00$                                     423.75$                                     812.50$                                     825.00$                                     

TOTAL 11,700.00$                       17,490.00$                       8,550.00$                         18,950.00$                       15,815.00$                       32,500.00$                       33,000.00$                       

Anchor Transportation Signature Transportation Divine Bus Charter Gray LineFirst Class

Intent to Award Date: 11/20/2025

by contacting the TTU Associate VP of Communications at www.tntech.edu/univadv/ocm/contact-us

Note to Bidders:  If you require any additional information, please contact the Buyer listed above 
within seven (7) calendar days of the Intent to Award Date.  After that time, additional information may be requested

Martin Motor Coach Metro Livery

Trip 5:   OVC Outdoor Championship


